Estates at Fairfax 

          Home Owners Association



Agenda for
Meeting 16 (Q3, 2008)

Meeting Date: September 8, 2008
Meeting Time:  6:30 – 8:30 PM

	Name
	E-mail Address
	Phone

	*
	AY – Alexanne Yi
	Alexanne_yi@fanniemae.com
	

	*
	CM – Cathy Moortgat
	Cmoortgat@gmail.com
	

	*
	MP – Marc Price
	Marcsprice@yahoo.com
	

	*
	SM – Sunil Monga
	Sunil@infogateway.com
	

	*
	TR – Tom Roth-Roffy
	Trothroffy@gmail.com
	

	
	ARB – Architectural Review Board 
	bdugan@dynalectric-dc.com
	


Resolved Action Items:

	Responsibility
	Discussion #
	Description
	Issued
	Done

	ALL
	1.1
	Newsletter for 2nd Quarter 2008

Cathy drafted the Newsletter for delivery in June, with details of the community annual meeting and block party.  All to distribute and promote awareness.
	6/09/08
	06/30/08

	ALL
	1.2
	Community Patio Party and Annual Meeting held on July 13, 2008 at 4:30pm at the Yis- 5255 Knight Arch Ct.
	6/09/08
	07/13/08

	ALL & ARB
	1.3
	The HOA Board & ARB members agreed on:

· The ARB guidelines that Randy has drafted.  

· Agreed that a formal application should be a part of the docs that homeowners must sign-Randy to draft an application similar to the existing form for review prior to posting all guidelines in our HOA website

· Grace to complete a gently worded write up of all ARB walk through findings for review prior to distribution

Update: Letters completed for review.  See 3.1 below.
	6/09/08
	09/08/08


Open Action Items:
	Responsibility
	Discussion 
	Description
	Issued
	Due

	
	
	
	
	

	ALL
	2.1
	Follow up on actions needed to get the Caution Children sign in place on Meadow Estates Drive 

OPEN-until the bond release (expected date 2Q2008) from Equity is complete, at which time the county will officially record Meadow Estates Drive as a county road.

UPDATE: Bond release is an open issue, with Equity Homes dissolving.  Issue will remain open until bond is resolved.  See open item 2.4 below.
UPDATE: There is no news to report on this issue. 
	03/12/07
	4Q2008

	AY&SM&BD
	2.2
	Discussed continued pursuit of Community Signage. Brian Dugan has volunteered to lead initiative

· Alex to provide a picture of a sign design to Brian

· Sunil to get an estimate from his contact on the foundation and brick work for the sign

· Brian to get a better quote from FAST Signs upon review of Alex’s design proposal, this will further assist in getting a better quote from other sign vendors

UPDATE: Bond release prior to positioning community sign at entrance is an open issue, with Equity Homes dissolving. Support for sign has dwindled with difficulty in housing market.  Issue will remain open until bond is resolved.  See open item 2.4 below.
UPDATE: We will not pursue this issue due to lack of interest from our community.
	03/12/07
	9/8/08

	MP
	2.3
	Landscaping company asked us what we want to do about dead trees in the front - there are many - an inquiry to Equity informed us they intend to replace them, eventually, to get off bond.
Update: Marc has respond to Landscaping company that Equity is responsible for trees as per bond.  However, bond is at issue.   Issue will remain open until bond is resolved.  See open item 2.4 below.
UPDATE: The due date has been moved to 4th quarter of 2008.
	3/10/08
	4Q2008

	ALL
	2.4
	
Equity Homes has been dissolved.  Bond release status remains a question, for roads, curbs, and trees.  Service First Management Company has been trying to schedule a meeting with Equity council to discuss (meeting originally schedule mid-June).  No additional news on bond status has been forth-coming from either Equity or Fairfax County.
UPDATE: No news on this issue. Alex will try to get the contact number of county person.

	6/09/08
	4Q2008

	
	
	
	
	


	Responsibility
	Discussion
	Description
	Issued
	Due

	
	
	
	
	

	ALL
	3.1
	Board to review the letters drafted by the Architectural Review Board to home owners:

· Issues identified during assessment walk of community

· Providing notice for issues identified

· Reminder of guidelines and change request form

UPDATE: Randy/Marc gave update on the ARB letters. Few defaults were dropped. It was decided that SFMC should mail these letters.


	9/08/08
	3Q2008

	ALL
	3.2
	Review and approve new proposal for Landscaping and Snow Removal.

UPDATE: Marc gave update on the Snow Removal proposal from AL&L. Snow Proposal was reviewed and it was found to be acceptable. We received wrong proposal on Landscaping. Marc will contact the landscaping company to send us the proposal.


	9/08/08
	3Q2008

	TR
	3.3
	Tom to provide Treasurer’s update on community financials

UPDATE: Tom gave update on the on community financial. He also reported that $2600 is in delinquent payments on HOA fee.
	9/08/08
	4Q2008

	ALL
	3.4
	Elections of Officers through mid- 2009

UPDATE: All the existing officers and board members were elected for another term.
	9/08/08
	9/8/08

	ALL
	3.5
	Schedule Next Quarterly Meeting (propose Monday 1 December 2008, 6:30pm)

UPDATE: Next meeting was planned on November 10, 2008
	9/08/08
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