Estates at Fairfax                 Home Owners Association
Estates at Fairfax 

          Home Owners Association



Meeting Minutes

Meeting 3


Meeting Date: Sept 11, 2006
Meeting Time:  6:30 – 8:30 PM

	Name
	E-mail Address
	Phone

	*
	AY – Alexanne Yi (writer)
	Alexanne_yi@freddiemac.com
	

	*
	CM – Cathy Moortgat
	Cmoortgat@gmail.com
	

	*
	MP – Marc Price
	Marcsprice@yahoo.com
	

	*
	SM – Stephanie Moumen
	Smoumen@charronconsulting.com
	

	*
	TR – Tom Roth-Roffy
	Trothroffy@gmail.com
	


Action Items:

	Responsibility
	Discussion #
	Description
	Issued
	Due

	
	
	
	
	

	MP
	1.2
	Follow up on termination of D&O policy for the association
	9/11/06
	

	MP
	1.3
	Request SFMC send out letter requesting for bids on landscaping and snow removal
	9/11/06
	9/16/06

	TBD
	1.8
	Writing letter to get the junk car in the parkland to be removed
	9/11/06
	

	SM
	1.9
	Find out status of dangling wire and write to Verizon
	9/11/06
	

	SM
	1.10
	Stephanie to further follow up on “watch of children” sign


	9/11/06
	

	CM & MP
	1.11
	Cathy to include pet waste clean-up waste issue on newsletter

Marc to ask Natasha to add the same issue on EAF website
	9/11/06
	

	CM
	1.13
	Cathy to make a Block Party Flyer for distribution
	9/11/06
	9/23/06

	CM
	1.14
	Cathy to find out more about community signage
	9/11/06
	9/16/06

	TR
	1.16
	Write letter to Equity reguesting for final application and neighbor signature for lot 40
	9/11/06
	9/17/06


Discussion

1.1 Reviewed action items from the last board meeting

1.2 Discuss possible termination of D&O policy with Ian Graham

1.3 Board members to provide feedback on HOA Directors Seminar by Lucia Anna Trigiani by Sept 30

1.4 One of the board member to join CAI

1.5 Marc to contact SFMC about getting bid proposal to set a contract for snow removal and landscaping

1.6 2005 Federal and State taxes are due Oct 16, 2006.  The prepared taxes have been reviewed by HOA president and treasurer, and copies were provided to all board members.

1.7 Ratified SFMC as authorized agent to perform financial transaction on behalf of the HOA- Marc, Tom and Alex signed docs.

1.8 Discussion on junk car removal in the walk path as it is still unremoved, Stephanie has called three times for status, must now consider writing a formal letter

1.9 Dangling wire in the walk path still not cleaned-up, must first find out if the County has done their part then must contact Verizon to complete

1.10 Stephanie to further follow up on “watch of children” sign

1.11 Discussed pet owner’s waste and clean-up, will include issue again in the community newsletter and include in the HOA website

1.12 Discussed possible community clean-up day to pick up trash around the community as well as the walk path

1.13 Block party discussion:

· Need to get people to sign up for what they are bringing

· Need name tags

· Need to get the word out about the party

· Shopping list to be made

· Flyer to be made by Cathy and distributed in person

1.14 Cathy Moortgat to find out the status of the request for neighborhood signage

1.15 Discuss possible candidate to serve on the Architectural Review Board (ARB), the possible candidate are: Marshall Williams, Atchutan Sriskandarajah and Tamer Moumen

1.16 Review of swimming pool/fence application for Lot 40 was completed, Tom to write a letter specifying additional documentation that include

· Formal application package

· Dimension of the board being used to make fence

· Description of style of fence finials

· Specifications of fence sealant, if any

The next meeting will be held on December 11 at 6:30 pm
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